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ABSTRACT 

Prostate cancer (PCa) is a heterogeneous disease with multifocal origin. In current clinical care, the Gleason scoring system 
is the well-established diagnosis by microscopic evaluation of the tissue from trans-rectal ultrasound (TRUS) guided 
biopsies. Nevertheless, the sensitivity and specificity in detecting PCa can range from 40 to 50% for conventional TRUS 
B-mode imaging. Tissue elasticity is associated with the disease progression and elastography technique has recently 
shown promise in aiding PCa diagnosis. However, many cancer foci in the prostate gland has very small size less than 1 
mm and those detected by medical elastography were larger than 2 mm. Hereby, we introduce optical coherence 
elastography (OCE) to quantify the prostate stiffness with high resolution in the magnitude of 10 µm. Following our 
feasibility study of 10 patients reported previously, we recruited 60 more patients undergoing 12-core TRUS guided 
biopsies for suspected PCa with a total of 720 biopsies. The stiffness of cancer tissue was approximately 57.63% higher 
than that of benign ones. Using histology as reference standard and cut-off threshold of 600kPa, the data analysis showed 
sensitivity and specificity of 89.6% and 99.8% respectively. The method also demonstrated potential in characterising 
different grades of PCa based on the change of tissue morphology and quantitative mechanical properties. In conclusion, 
quantitative OCE can be a reliable technique to identify PCa lesion and differentiate indolent from aggressive cancer.   

Keywords: Prostate cancer, Gleason score, elasticity, optical coherence elastography  

 

1. INTRODUCTION 

Prostate adenocarcinoma (PCa) is the most common cancer in men in the UK. In the routine clinical care, patients are 
suspected with PCa if they have a raised serum prostate-specific antigen (PSA) level and/or abnormal digital rectal 
examination (DRE) result. Conventional ultrasound is a popular clinical imaging technique for lesion anatomy based on 
the acoustic properties of soft tissues, but many soft tissues can share similar ultrasonic echogenicity. In prostate ultrasound 
imaging, trans-rectal ultrasound (TRUS) guided biopsy is already in use clinically around the world to guide prostate 
biopsies. However, tumours of prostate may be invisible or barely invisible in standard ultrasound examinations, which 
leads to unreliable assessment of the tumour volume 1 and cancer staging 2, 3. The cancer staging is confirmed by the 
histopathologic verification under microscope using Gleason scoring system 4 that is relied on the knowledge and 
experience of the histopathologists. Generally, a higher Gleason score means a more aggressive tumour and a worse 
prognosis. However, an inter-observer variation exists between two histopathologists besides a large discrepancy existing 
on initial biopsy and after the final radical prostatectomy (RP). Cohen et al. 2 conducted a meta-analysis of 14839 patients 
worldwide, who were diagnosed of PCa with TRUS biopsy and then underwent RP. It was found that only 58% of the 
patients in whom the RP grade was accurately predicted. In addition, it is controversial about the sensitivity and specificity 
of the technique, as well as associated risks of overdiagnosis and overtreatment. Therefore, a quantitative diagnosis is of 
high demand to make an optimal decision for PCa treatment.  



 

 

 
 

The differing elasticity of soft tissue has been an established practice for centuries to differentiate healthy from diseased 
tissue, especially in breast and prostate tissue. PCa was traditionally diagnosed with DRE of the prostate by feeling the 
stiffness alteration in the prostate. Initially, the mechanical evaluation of prostate elasticity was investigated by Krouskop 
et al. 5 with displacement loading experiments. It was found that tissue from PCa has a measurable elevated Young’s 
modulus compared with the normal prostate glandular tissue, and tissue from prostate with benign prostatic hyperplasia 
(BPH) is significantly softer than normal tissue. Elastography enables deeper tissue elasticity imaging based on the 
assumption that soft tissue is a linear elastic solid with isotropic mechanical properties 6, 7. Ultrasound elastography has 
become a commonly used approach for clinical elasticity imaging especially quasi-static ultrasound based elastography 8. 
However, it depends largely on the performing skills of the operator. Moreover, many cancer foci in the prostate gland has 
very small size less than 1 mm 9, whilst the spatial scales of current elastography techniques limit their applications to 
identify such small lesions. Alternatively, optical imaging can break the limit of ultrasound and magnetic resonance 
imaging (MRI) to achieve micro-scale resolution 10. 

Optical coherence tomography (OCT) is an emerging optical imaging technique which works similar to ultrasound except 
that OCT uses near-infrared light rather than acoustical waves. OCT enables micro-scale spatial resolution and millimetre-
scale imaging depth 10. In the landmark paper published in 1998, Schmitt et al. 11 first employed optical coherence 
tomography (OCT) 12 to measure local displacement induced by quasi-static compression. Elastography with OCT is 
termed as optical coherence elastography (OCE). The early OCE studies relied on the pioneer work of Schmitt et al. using 
the speckle-tracking method with cross correlation technique to detect the tissue response after loading. Speckle is the fine-
scale, random, mottled intensity pattern generated by the sub-resolution sample scatters present in all coherent imaging 
systems. Instead of using changes in the intensity information, phase-sensitive method obtains the phase information from 
complex OCT signal 13. Phase-sensitive method has large displacement dynamic range, about 20-fold greater than for the 
latter one 14, as well as a high spatial resolution that is comparable to the underlying OCT system. Guan et al. 15 combined 
phase-sensitive OCT with an ultrasound transducer to provide quantitative Young’s modulus of a degenerated tendon 
model with a high spatial resolution. A high signal to noise ratio was reported to monitor the elasticity alteration of the 
tendon treated with collagenase of different concentration and time. It presented the clinical potential of using the method 
of the phase-sensitive OCE combined with vibration stimulation for disease evaluation.  

Similarly, a preliminary work 16 was conducted in ex vivo PCa detection for the first time with 120 biopsies from 10 
patients by following the method of Guan et al. It proved that OCE can reliably differentiate benign and malignant prostate 
tissues with a high diagnostic accuracy. Additionally, the preliminary results demonstrated the distinct structural image 
and elastogram of biopsies of different Gleason score. Due to a small number of patients recruited, the previous work did 
not clearly show the impact of quantitative tissue stiffness on the diagnosis of Gleason score. In this paper, we present a 
large clinical study of 60 patients suspected with PCa using vibration OCE method. Building on the previous study, we 
will perform point by point comparison between 3D OCE images and histological images of each biopsy core. The 
quantitative Young’s modulus value of the prostate biopsies will be statistically analysed based on the cancer 
aggressiveness. The aim of this continuing study aims to develop a quantitative biomarker to help the diagnosis of PCa 
more accurate.  

 

2. METHODOLOGY 

Patients and biopsies 

We recruited 60 patients (age range 56-85) diagnosed with TRUS guided 12-core biopsy between April 2014 and 
December 2015, 11 of whom underwent RP afterwards at Ninewells Hospital. Ethical approval was granted by Tayside 
ethical committee (14/ES/0049). Informed consent was obtained from all the patients before their biopsy procedures for 
the reported study. According to the histopathologic report after the vibration OCE, there are 37 PCa patients, 1 patient 
with carcinosarcoma, and 22 patients not suspicious of malignancy whose biopsies were classified to the region of 
benign/normal biopsy tissues. Two combined Gleason scores are usually assigned to the PCa patients to evaluate the 
aggressiveness and prognosis of the cancer with a higher number to be more malignant. Wherein the lowest score given is 



 

 

 
 

Gleason 3+3=6 17 in the current clinical care. At least one non-cancerous prostate diseases were reported in 17 patients 
among the 22 cancer-free patients, for instance, benign prostatic hyperplasia (BPH), atypical small acinar proliferation 
(ASAP), prostatitis and/or prostatic intraepithelial neoplasia (PIN). Table 2 displays the details of patient number and 
percentage for each classification.  

Table 1. Histopathologic classification of patients suspected with prostate cancer. 

Category Number of patients Percentage 
Prostate adenocarcinoma 37 61.7 % 

Carcinosarcoma 1 1.7 % 
Non-cancerous disease 17 28.3 % 

Disease-free 5 8.3 % 
Total 60 100% 

 

The 60 participants received standard 12-core based biopsies guided by TRUS from different regions of prostate gland. 
Overall, a total of 720 cores of tissue specimens were included in this study. The biopsy size was mainly determined by 
the geometry of the 18-gauge biopsy needle and the force applied during the operation procedure. Each biopsy was a 
circular core approximately 0.8-1.2 mm in diameter and 5-20 mm in length. For each patient, the 12 specimens were put 
into 10% neutral buffered formalin (50 mL) immediately after TRUS procedure and stored in the independent containers. 
According to the previous study 18 of the effect of fixative on tissue stiffness, the samples were embedded in the formalin 
for 24 hours before the elasticity test (OCE) was performed on each biopsy.   

After the OCE imaging, biopsies were then sent to the pathology department at Ninewells Hospital preparing for the 
pathological analysis using a routine histological protocol. The haematoxylin and eosin (H&E) staining was applied to 
exam the cellular structure and report the degree of malignancy. After processing the tissue, the ~5 µm section was mounted 
between a glass slide and coverslip. At least three histological slices were obtained from each biopsy. Lastly, the staging 
and percentage of cancer involvement were reported by an experienced pathologist (SL) blinded to the OCE data. A total 
720 cores were categorised into two major groups according to the pathological results: namely non-cancerous prostate 
tissue (448 core biopsies) and malignant prostate tissue (272 core biopsies). Among them, there were 260 PCa samples 
which were further divided into 7 sub-groups as shown in Table 2. This sampling size with a varied spectrum should be 
sufficient for evaluating OCE imaging in the diagnosis of PCa with different aggressiveness.   

Table 2. Histopathologic classification of biopsies from patients diagnosed with prostate cancer. 

Gleason score 3+3 3+4 3+5 4+3 4+4 4+5 5+4 Total 
Number of biopsies 58 54 4 46 48 39 11 260 

Percentage 22.3% 20.8% 1.5% 17.7% 18.5% 15.0% 4.2% 100% 
 

Optical Coherence Elastography (OCE) 

The OCE system consists of two main parts: signal detection and vibration stimulation as illustrated in Figure 1. For signal 
detection, a phase-sensitive optical coherence tomography (PhS-OCT) with spectral-domain configuration is adapted to 
measure the displacement of tissues. The PhS-OCT system employs a superluminescent diode (SLD, Thorlabs) as a 
broadband light source, with a centre wavelength of ∼1302 nm and bandwidth of ∼85 nm. For the system performance, it 
provides an axial resolution of 8.8 μm and a transverse resolution of 7.9 μm in air. Additionally, the dynamic range of the 
PhS-OCT system is ∼100 dB at 0.5-mm axial depth with a phase noise of 3 mrad. However, the signal to noise ratio (SNR) 
in the region of interest (ROI) of the tissue sample is ∼50 dB. The acquisition rate is determined by the spectrometer of a 
maximum rate of ∼76,335 A-scans/s. To generate vibration, a sine-wave signal modulated at ~8 kHz is generated by a 
function waveform generator (Agilent Technologies, USA) and an amplifier (AE Techron). The signal is then sent to drive 
a magnet shaker (Brüel & Kjær Sound & Vibration Measurement A/S, Denmark). The vibration is transmitted from the 
shaker to compress the sample and trigger vibration within the sample in the axial direction.  



 

 

 
 

 
Figure 1. A schematic of system setup of the vibration OCE system consisting of (a) signal detection using PhS-OCT and (b) 
vibration stimulation using a shaker. SLD (superluminescent diode), CCD (charged coupled device) line-scan camera. 

 

A schematic of the scanning protocol is shown in Figure 2 for the acquisition of a cross-sectional two-dimensional (2D) 
structure and elastogram. While the shaker continued to fire the stimulus to the sample, the vibration signal was acquired 
using M-B mode. To form an M-scan image, the PhS-OCT beam stayed at one location of the sample for 256 repeats. A 
complete B-scan (a cross-section view) consists of 256 × 256 A-scans. Three-dimensional (3D) elastogram was then 
realized with consecutive B scans along the length of the prostate biopsy at an interval of 50 µm. Herein the acquisition 
time for a set of OCE data was 3 minutes for a size of 2 mm × 2 mm × 3 mm. After the acquisition of one data set, the 
transitional stage was moved 2.5 mm in y direction for next acquisition, and repeated until the whole biopsy core was 
scanned. During the OCE scanning, the biopsy core was placed on 2% agar phantom with a thickness of ~8 mm as an 
elasticity reference 19. The total scanning time for each biopsy was dependent on the biopsy length, approximately 20 
minutes on average. Finally, the raw structure and elastogram data sets were processed by MATLAB R2015b (The 
MathWorks, Natick, MA, USA) 15 to generate structural and elastogram frames for each B-scan. The frames were then 
imported into Amira (Mercury Computer Systems, Berlin, Germany) and reconstructed into 3D data sets at full resolution.   

 
Figure 2. A schematic of the scanning protocol using M-B mode for the prostate biopsy tissue, wherein the agar phantom is 
used as a reference, x-axis is the lateral position of the sample, z-axis is the direction of laser beam, and t-axis represents the 
time location during M-scan.  

 



 

 

 
 

A systematic statistical method was conducted blinded to OCE and histological data to examine the reliability of 
quantitative OCE in differentiating benign and malignant prostate tissues as well as determining sensitivity and specificity 
of this technology. The estimated Young’s modulus (kPa) was compared among malignant and benign tissues, as well as 
different Gleason scores. All the analyses were performed with SPSS 22 (SPSS, Chicago, IL, USA). Differences between 
the groups were assessed using the Games-Howell test. P value of 0.05 was considered to be statistically significant.  

 

3. RESULTS 

3D elastogram 

The cancer involvement was reported by the histopathologist and the histological images were obtained by imaging the 
biopsy slide under the microscope with a fitted camera. The elastogram of a whole biopsy obtained from phase-sensitive 
OCE are compared with the histologic images in this study as demonstrated in Figure 3-7. Herein the Young’s modulus of 
the biopsy is colour coded with red to be ~300 kPa and yellow to be 1000 kPa. In Figure 3, a benign biopsy is the control 
group for the other 4 malignant PCa biopsies of different Gleason score with a sum from 6 to 9. The average stiffness of a 
benign biopsy is approximately 492.0 kPa (SD=44.4 kPa) as shown in Figure 3 indicated in dark red colour. In Figure 4-
7, the origin and end of the malignant area is labelled with the red arrows. As shown in the 4 biopsies, the malignant area 
in the 3D elastograms matches with that in the histologic images. Wherein, the colour enhancement of the elastogram from 
light yellow to bright yellow was observed in the malignant region of the PCa biopsies from Figure 4 to Figure 7. It 
indicates an increase of Gleason sum and cancer involvement with the rise of Young’s modulus.  

 
Figure 3. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of benign biopsy 

 

 
Figure 4. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 3+3 with 30% 
cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy. 

 



 

 

 
 

 
Figure 5. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 3+4 with 40% 
cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy. 

 

 
Figure 6. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 4+4 with 60% 
cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy. 

 

 
Figure 7. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 4+5 with 80% 
cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy. 

 

Statistical analysis 

To validate the diagnostic accuracy of the vibration OCE method, the weighted average Young’s modulus value was 
calculated over the whole area within each biopsy. The average Young’s modulus of cancer and benign biopsies is 698.43 
(SD=125.29 kPa) and 443.07 (SD=88.95 kPa) respectively. Results from PCa and benign prostate tissue are illustrated 
with the whisker plot in Figure 8 (a). A significant increase of stiffness can be observed (p < 0.001) between benign and 
PCa tissue. In Figure 8 (a), PCa is suspected with the Young’s modulus higher than 600 kPa (cutoff) after comparing the 
elasticity data obtained from OCE and the corresponding histological report. Hence, the biopsies of the Young’s modulus 
value higher than 600 kPa are treated as positive result with PCa, and the others are negative result of cancer-free biopsies. 



 

 

 
 

The data analysis shows that the sensitivity and specificity are 89.6% and 99.8% using 600 kPa as a threshold. The 
relationship between Gleason score and the estimated Young’s modulus is compared in Figure 8 (b). There is a significant 
difference noticed among Young’s modulus of different Gleason scores estimated by OCE (p Value < 0.05) except for that 
of Gleason score 7 and 8 (p value = 0.765).  

 
Figure 8. Young’s modulus comparison of (a) benign and malignant biopsies and (b) biopsies of different Gleason sum. 

 

4. DISCUSSION AND CONCLUSION 

This study utilized a novel optical imaging method, the phase-sensitive OCE with vibration, to estimate the mechanical 
properties of the prostate tissue. The estimated tissue stiffness was used to categorise specimens into different histological 
classifications. Quantitative 3D elastogram of a prostate biopsy can also be reconstructed in high resolution from 
consecutive 2D elastograms. Using a threshold of 600 kPa, the vibration OCE shows promising ability in PCa detection 
with a high sensitivity and specificity. Additionally, both the 3D elastograms and the statistical analysis illustrates an 
ascending trend of the quantitative stiffness with the increase of Gleeson scores.  

As noted the prostate biopsies in this study are fixed in the formalin solution before the OCE evaluation, but the tissues 
should be fixed to the same extend after 24 hours according to our previous study 18. The diagnostic accuracy analysed in 
this study is relied on the histopathological verification requiring the knowledge and experience of the histopathologist. 
However, the early cancer with the pattern of Gleason score smaller than 3 is difficult to be distinguished by naked eyes 
and as a result the lowest Gleason score reported is 3+3 in the current clinical care. This can be the explanation of the case 
when the benign prostate biopsy has high stiffness detected by the vibration OCE in this study.  

In conclusion, this study presents the vibration OCE to estimate the Young’s modulus of prostate biopsies from 60 patients 
suspected with PCa. Based on a total of 720 biopsies, the results proved that this method is capable to differentiate benign 
from malignant biopsies with a high diagnostic accuracy, as well as quantify the cancer malignancy. Thus, the Young’s 
modulus of the prostate biopsy is potential to be used as a mechanical biomarker to detect PCa and distinguish cancer with 
different aggressiveness. On the basis of the findings from this study, a future perspective is the in-vivo study with the 
OCE needle probe to realise real-time diagnosis of PCa and accurate characterisation of the malignancy.  
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Abstract

[bookmark: OLE_LINK1]Prostate cancer (PCa) is a heterogeneous disease with multifocal origin. In current clinical care, the Gleason scoring system is the well-established diagnosis by microscopic evaluation of the tissue from trans-rectal ultrasound (TRUS) guided biopsies. Nevertheless, the sensitivity and specificity in detecting PCa can range from 40 to 50% for conventional TRUS B-mode imaging. Tissue elasticity is associated with the disease progression and elastography technique has recently shown promise in aiding PCa diagnosis. However, many cancer foci in the prostate gland has very small size less than 1 mm and those detected by medical elastography were larger than 2 mm. Hereby, we introduce optical coherence elastography (OCE) to quantify the prostate stiffness with high resolution in the magnitude of 10 µm. Following our feasibility study of 10 patients reported previously, we recruited 60 more patients undergoing 12-core TRUS guided biopsies for suspected PCa with a total of 720 biopsies. The stiffness of cancer tissue was approximately 57.63% higher than that of benign ones. Using histology as reference standard and cut-off threshold of 600kPa, the data analysis showed sensitivity and specificity of 89.6% and 99.8% respectively. The method also demonstrated potential in characterising different grades of PCa based on the change of tissue morphology and quantitative mechanical properties. In conclusion, quantitative OCE can be a reliable technique to identify PCa lesion and differentiate indolent from aggressive cancer.  
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INTRODUCTION

[bookmark: OLE_LINK62]Prostate adenocarcinoma (PCa) is the most common cancer in men in the UK. In the routine clinical care, patients are suspected with PCa if they have a raised serum prostate-specific antigen (PSA) level and/or abnormal digital rectal examination (DRE) result. Conventional ultrasound is a popular clinical imaging technique for lesion anatomy based on the acoustic properties of soft tissues, but many soft tissues can share similar ultrasonic echogenicity. In prostate ultrasound imaging, trans-rectal ultrasound (TRUS) guided biopsy is already in use clinically around the world to guide prostate biopsies. However, tumours of prostate may be invisible or barely invisible in standard ultrasound examinations, which leads to unreliable assessment of the tumour volume 1 and cancer staging 2, 3. The cancer staging is confirmed by the histopathologic verification under microscope using Gleason scoring system 4 that is relied on the knowledge and experience of the histopathologists. Generally, a higher Gleason score means a more aggressive tumour and a worse prognosis. However, an inter-observer variation exists between two histopathologists besides a large discrepancy existing on initial biopsy and after the final radical prostatectomy (RP). Cohen et al. 2 conducted a meta-analysis of 14839 patients worldwide, who were diagnosed of PCa with TRUS biopsy and then underwent RP. It was found that only 58% of the patients in whom the RP grade was accurately predicted. In addition, it is controversial about the sensitivity and specificity of the technique, as well as associated risks of overdiagnosis and overtreatment. Therefore, a quantitative diagnosis is of high demand to make an optimal decision for PCa treatment. 

[bookmark: OLE_LINK53]The differing elasticity of soft tissue has been an established practice for centuries to differentiate healthy from diseased tissue, especially in breast and prostate tissue. PCa was traditionally diagnosed with DRE of the prostate by feeling the stiffness alteration in the prostate. Initially, the mechanical evaluation of prostate elasticity was investigated by Krouskop et al. 5 with displacement loading experiments. It was found that tissue from PCa has a measurable elevated Young’s modulus compared with the normal prostate glandular tissue, and tissue from prostate with benign prostatic hyperplasia (BPH) is significantly softer than normal tissue. Elastography enables deeper tissue elasticity imaging based on the assumption that soft tissue is a linear elastic solid with isotropic mechanical properties 6, 7. Ultrasound elastography has become a commonly used approach for clinical elasticity imaging especially quasi-static ultrasound based elastography 8. However, it depends largely on the performing skills of the operator. Moreover, many cancer foci in the prostate gland has very small size less than 1 mm 9, whilst the spatial scales of current elastography techniques limit their applications to identify such small lesions. Alternatively, optical imaging can break the limit of ultrasound and magnetic resonance imaging (MRI) to achieve micro-scale resolution 10.

Optical coherence tomography (OCT) is an emerging optical imaging technique which works similar to ultrasound except that OCT uses near-infrared light rather than acoustical waves. OCT enables micro-scale spatial resolution and millimetre-scale imaging depth 10. In the landmark paper published in 1998, Schmitt et al. 11 first employed optical coherence tomography (OCT) 12 to measure local displacement induced by quasi-static compression. Elastography with OCT is termed as optical coherence elastography (OCE). The early OCE studies relied on the pioneer work of Schmitt et al. using the speckle-tracking method with cross correlation technique to detect the tissue response after loading. Speckle is the fine-scale, random, mottled intensity pattern generated by the sub-resolution sample scatters present in all coherent imaging systems. Instead of using changes in the intensity information, phase-sensitive method obtains the phase information from complex OCT signal 13. Phase-sensitive method has large displacement dynamic range, about 20-fold greater than for the latter one 14, as well as a high spatial resolution that is comparable to the underlying OCT system. Guan et al. 15 combined phase-sensitive OCT with an ultrasound transducer to provide quantitative Young’s modulus of a degenerated tendon model with a high spatial resolution. A high signal to noise ratio was reported to monitor the elasticity alteration of the tendon treated with collagenase of different concentration and time. It presented the clinical potential of using the method of the phase-sensitive OCE combined with vibration stimulation for disease evaluation. 

Similarly, a preliminary work 16 was conducted in ex vivo PCa detection for the first time with 120 biopsies from 10 patients by following the method of Guan et al. It proved that OCE can reliably differentiate benign and malignant prostate tissues with a high diagnostic accuracy. Additionally, the preliminary results demonstrated the distinct structural image and elastogram of biopsies of different Gleason score. Due to a small number of patients recruited, the previous work did not clearly show the impact of quantitative tissue stiffness on the diagnosis of Gleason score. In this paper, we present a large clinical study of 60 patients suspected with PCa using vibration OCE method. Building on the previous study, we will perform point by point comparison between 3D OCE images and histological images of each biopsy core. The quantitative Young’s modulus value of the prostate biopsies will be statistically analysed based on the cancer aggressiveness. The aim of this continuing study aims to develop a quantitative biomarker to help the diagnosis of PCa more accurate. 



METHODOLOGY

Patients and biopsies

We recruited 60 patients (age range 56-85) diagnosed with TRUS guided 12-core biopsy between April 2014 and December 2015, 11 of whom underwent RP afterwards at Ninewells Hospital. Ethical approval was granted by Tayside ethical committee (14/ES/0049). Informed consent was obtained from all the patients before their biopsy procedures for the reported study. According to the histopathologic report after the vibration OCE, there are 37 PCa patients, 1 patient with carcinosarcoma, and 22 patients not suspicious of malignancy whose biopsies were classified to the region of benign/normal biopsy tissues. Two combined Gleason scores are usually assigned to the PCa patients to evaluate the aggressiveness and prognosis of the cancer with a higher number to be more malignant. Wherein the lowest score given is Gleason 3+3=6 17 in the current clinical care. At least one non-cancerous prostate diseases were reported in 17 patients among the 22 cancer-free patients, for instance, benign prostatic hyperplasia (BPH), atypical small acinar proliferation (ASAP), prostatitis and/or prostatic intraepithelial neoplasia (PIN). Table 2 displays the details of patient number and percentage for each classification. 

Table 1. Histopathologic classification of patients suspected with prostate cancer.

		Category

		Number of patients

		Percentage



		Prostate adenocarcinoma

		37

		61.7 %



		Carcinosarcoma

		1

		1.7 %



		Non-cancerous disease

		17

		28.3 %



		Disease-free

		5

		8.3 %



		Total

		60

		100%







The 60 participants received standard 12-core based biopsies guided by TRUS from different regions of prostate gland. Overall, a total of 720 cores of tissue specimens were included in this study. The biopsy size was mainly determined by the geometry of the 18-gauge biopsy needle and the force applied during the operation procedure. Each biopsy was a circular core approximately 0.8-1.2 mm in diameter and 5-20 mm in length. For each patient, the 12 specimens were put into 10% neutral buffered formalin (50 mL) immediately after TRUS procedure and stored in the independent containers. According to the previous study 18 of the effect of fixative on tissue stiffness, the samples were embedded in the formalin for 24 hours before the elasticity test (OCE) was performed on each biopsy.  

After the OCE imaging, biopsies were then sent to the pathology department at Ninewells Hospital preparing for the pathological analysis using a routine histological protocol. The haematoxylin and eosin (H&E) staining was applied to exam the cellular structure and report the degree of malignancy. After processing the tissue, the ~5 µm section was mounted between a glass slide and coverslip. At least three histological slices were obtained from each biopsy. Lastly, the staging and percentage of cancer involvement were reported by an experienced pathologist (SL) blinded to the OCE data. A total 720 cores were categorised into two major groups according to the pathological results: namely non-cancerous prostate tissue (448 core biopsies) and malignant prostate tissue (272 core biopsies). Among them, there were 260 PCa samples which were further divided into 7 sub-groups as shown in Table 2. This sampling size with a varied spectrum should be sufficient for evaluating OCE imaging in the diagnosis of PCa with different aggressiveness.  

Table 2. Histopathologic classification of biopsies from patients diagnosed with prostate cancer.

		Gleason score

		3+3

		3+4

		3+5

		4+3

		4+4

		4+5

		5+4

		Total



		Number of biopsies

		58

		54

		4

		46

		48

		39

		11

		260



		Percentage

		22.3%

		20.8%

		1.5%

		17.7%

		18.5%

		15.0%

		4.2%

		100%







Optical Coherence Elastography (OCE)

The OCE system consists of two main parts: signal detection and vibration stimulation as illustrated in Figure 1. For signal detection, a phase-sensitive optical coherence tomography (PhS-OCT) with spectral-domain configuration is adapted to measure the displacement of tissues. The PhS-OCT system employs a superluminescent diode (SLD, Thorlabs) as a broadband light source, with a centre wavelength of ∼1302 nm and bandwidth of ∼85 nm. For the system performance, it provides an axial resolution of 8.8 μm and a transverse resolution of 7.9 μm in air. Additionally, the dynamic range of the PhS-OCT system is ∼100 dB at 0.5-mm axial depth with a phase noise of 3 mrad. However, the signal to noise ratio (SNR) in the region of interest (ROI) of the tissue sample is ∼50 dB. The acquisition rate is determined by the spectrometer of a maximum rate of ∼76,335 A-scans/s. To generate vibration, a sine-wave signal modulated at ~8 kHz is generated by a function waveform generator (Agilent Technologies, USA) and an amplifier (AE Techron). The signal is then sent to drive a magnet shaker (Brüel & Kjær Sound & Vibration Measurement A/S, Denmark). The vibration is transmitted from the shaker to compress the sample and trigger vibration within the sample in the axial direction. 

[image: ]

Figure 1. A schematic of system setup of the vibration OCE system consisting of (a) signal detection using PhS-OCT and (b) vibration stimulation using a shaker. SLD (superluminescent diode), CCD (charged coupled device) line-scan camera.



A schematic of the scanning protocol is shown in Figure 2 for the acquisition of a cross-sectional two-dimensional (2D) structure and elastogram. While the shaker continued to fire the stimulus to the sample, the vibration signal was acquired using M-B mode. To form an M-scan image, the PhS-OCT beam stayed at one location of the sample for 256 repeats. A complete B-scan (a cross-section view) consists of 256 × 256 A-scans. Three-dimensional (3D) elastogram was then realized with consecutive B scans along the length of the prostate biopsy at an interval of 50 µm. Herein the acquisition time for a set of OCE data was 3 minutes for a size of 2 mm × 2 mm × 3 mm. After the acquisition of one data set, the transitional stage was moved 2.5 mm in y direction for next acquisition, and repeated until the whole biopsy core was scanned. During the OCE scanning, the biopsy core was placed on 2% agar phantom with a thickness of ~8 mm as an elasticity reference 19. The total scanning time for each biopsy was dependent on the biopsy length, approximately 20 minutes on average. Finally, the raw structure and elastogram data sets were processed by MATLAB R2015b (The MathWorks, Natick, MA, USA) 15 to generate structural and elastogram frames for each B-scan. The frames were then imported into Amira (Mercury Computer Systems, Berlin, Germany) and reconstructed into 3D data sets at full resolution.  

[image: ]

Figure 2. A schematic of the scanning protocol using M-B mode for the prostate biopsy tissue, wherein the agar phantom is used as a reference, x-axis is the lateral position of the sample, z-axis is the direction of laser beam, and t-axis represents the time location during M-scan. 



A systematic statistical method was conducted blinded to OCE and histological data to examine the reliability of quantitative OCE in differentiating benign and malignant prostate tissues as well as determining sensitivity and specificity of this technology. The estimated Young’s modulus (kPa) was compared among malignant and benign tissues, as well as different Gleason scores. All the analyses were performed with SPSS 22 (SPSS, Chicago, IL, USA). Differences between the groups were assessed using the Games-Howell test. P value of 0.05 was considered to be statistically significant. 



RESULTS

3D elastogram

The cancer involvement was reported by the histopathologist and the histological images were obtained by imaging the biopsy slide under the microscope with a fitted camera. The elastogram of a whole biopsy obtained from phase-sensitive OCE are compared with the histologic images in this study as demonstrated in Figure 3-7. Herein the Young’s modulus of the biopsy is colour coded with red to be ~300 kPa and yellow to be 1000 kPa. In Figure 3, a benign biopsy is the control group for the other 4 malignant PCa biopsies of different Gleason score with a sum from 6 to 9. The average stiffness of a benign biopsy is approximately 492.0 kPa (SD=44.4 kPa) as shown in Figure 3 indicated in dark red colour. In Figure 4-7, the origin and end of the malignant area is labelled with the red arrows. As shown in the 4 biopsies, the malignant area in the 3D elastograms matches with that in the histologic images. Wherein, the colour enhancement of the elastogram from light yellow to bright yellow was observed in the malignant region of the PCa biopsies from Figure 4 to Figure 7. It indicates an increase of Gleason sum and cancer involvement with the rise of Young’s modulus. 

[image: ]

Figure 3. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of benign biopsy
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Figure 4. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 3+3 with 30% cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy.



[image: ]

Figure 5. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 3+4 with 40% cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy.
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Figure 6. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 4+4 with 60% cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy.



[image: ]

Figure 7. Comparison between histologic image (a) and 3D elastogram (b) of PCa biopsy of Gleason score 4+5 with 80% cancer involvement. The red arrows indicate the start and end of malignancy.



Statistical analysis

[bookmark: OLE_LINK42]To validate the diagnostic accuracy of the vibration OCE method, the weighted average Young’s modulus value was calculated over the whole area within each biopsy. The average Young’s modulus of cancer and benign biopsies is 698.43 (SD=125.29 kPa) and 443.07 (SD=88.95 kPa) respectively. Results from PCa and benign prostate tissue are illustrated with the whisker plot in Figure 8 (a). A significant increase of stiffness can be observed (p < 0.001) between benign and PCa tissue. In Figure 8 (a), PCa is suspected with the Young’s modulus higher than 600 kPa (cutoff) after comparing the elasticity data obtained from OCE and the corresponding histological report. Hence, the biopsies of the Young’s modulus value higher than 600 kPa are treated as positive result with PCa, and the others are negative result of cancer-free biopsies. The data analysis shows that the sensitivity and specificity are 89.6% and 99.8% using 600 kPa as a threshold. The relationship between Gleason score and the estimated Young’s modulus is compared in Figure 8 (b). There is a significant difference noticed among Young’s modulus of different Gleason scores estimated by OCE (p Value < 0.05) except for that of Gleason score 7 and 8 (p value = 0.765). 
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Figure 8. Young’s modulus comparison of (a) benign and malignant biopsies and (b) biopsies of different Gleason sum.



DISCUSSION AND CONCLUSION

This study utilized a novel optical imaging method, the phase-sensitive OCE with vibration, to estimate the mechanical properties of the prostate tissue. The estimated tissue stiffness was used to categorise specimens into different histological classifications. Quantitative 3D elastogram of a prostate biopsy can also be reconstructed in high resolution from consecutive 2D elastograms. Using a threshold of 600 kPa, the vibration OCE shows promising ability in PCa detection with a high sensitivity and specificity. Additionally, both the 3D elastograms and the statistical analysis illustrates an ascending trend of the quantitative stiffness with the increase of Gleeson scores. 

As noted the prostate biopsies in this study are fixed in the formalin solution before the OCE evaluation, but the tissues should be fixed to the same extend after 24 hours according to our previous study 18. The diagnostic accuracy analysed in this study is relied on the histopathological verification requiring the knowledge and experience of the histopathologist. However, the early cancer with the pattern of Gleason score smaller than 3 is difficult to be distinguished by naked eyes and as a result the lowest Gleason score reported is 3+3 in the current clinical care. This can be the explanation of the case when the benign prostate biopsy has high stiffness detected by the vibration OCE in this study. 

[bookmark: _GoBack]In conclusion, this study presents the vibration OCE to estimate the Young’s modulus of prostate biopsies from 60 patients suspected with PCa. Based on a total of 720 biopsies, the results proved that this method is capable to differentiate benign from malignant biopsies with a high diagnostic accuracy, as well as quantify the cancer malignancy. Thus, the Young’s modulus of the prostate biopsy is potential to be used as a mechanical biomarker to detect PCa and distinguish cancer with different aggressiveness. On the basis of the findings from this study, a future perspective is the in-vivo study with the OCE needle probe to realise real-time diagnosis of PCa and accurate characterisation of the malignancy. 
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