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KATE BOWER, TEENA CLERKE AND ALISON LEE

12. ENDANGERED PRACTICES

Writing Feminist Research

GENESIS OF THE CHAPTER

Alison: When an invitation to write a chapter on feminist writing for this book
arrived on my desk, my first response was to think: ~I don't have time to do
feminist work any more, I have nothing to say". A moment's reflection revealed,
however, that I actually spend a good deal of my time working in supervision with
doctoral students who are undertaking feminist research. The pedagogical
relationships of supervision are one important site for the production of feminist
knowledge and identity - and for the practice of feminist writing.

The situation in which I find myself, 15 years out from my own doctorate, and
preoccupied with the demands of managementand intensified working conditions,is
to look for the spaces and cracks in which feminist scholarship can still be done.
For me, doctoral pedagogy is one such space. I am therefore still able to be
involved in doingfeminist intellectual work- once removed.

Thisbrief sketch serves as a framing for the focus of this chapter, which is concerned
with the conditions under which feminist research can be done in current times.
This chapter is a co-production between a senior academic and two doctoral
students, engaged in supervision and joint writing about feminist- scholarship. We
aim to contribute to a discussion about the terms and conditions in which feminist
research can be done in the university today, with a particular focus on the
"practice disciplines". Our title, "Endangered practices: Writing feminist research"
refers to the risks and uncertainties of undertaking feminist work in fields where
there is not always a strong tradition of feminist scholarship, to the possibilities and
challenges of doing so, and to the kinds of writing that it is productive and
instructive to engage in. Our title also alludes to the different senses signified by
practice in the discussion: the practice of writing research and writing research on
practice.

We draw on our quite different experiences to illustrate some of the main issues
and opportunities for feminist research writing, with a view to offering some ways
forward for researchers wanting to explore questions of practice from a feminist
perspective. We take brief "thumbnails" of our different positions on these issues,
as points of departure for developing some shared thoughts and insights.

In what follows, we are less concerned with questions of distinctive feminist
methodologies or "women's ways of knowing" than with exploring what is
possible in circumstances that areoften described by critics as post-feminist. We
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